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The main reason for purchasing a lightning warning device is for lightning 
warning.  While there may be additional valuable information provided for 
safety, like heat warnings, precise lightning warnings are imperative.  

Thor Guard has utilized over 50 years of experience to continually advance our 
older technology to improve our systems. We do not use any delayed and 
inaccurate detection networks and we never rely on any internet connectivity to 
operate. Perry Weather products have no local detection technology but relies 
on someone else’s network to receive internet-delivered lightning data every five 
minutes.  Yes, our software is fantastic, but it is developed to fully utilize our 
advanced prediction technology to deliver instantaneous, site-specific lightning. 
severe storm and tornado warnings.

Perry Weather has provided, on their website, some intentionally misleading 
“facts” and these need to be corrected in a truthful manner.  The comparison to 
follow is just that - factual and truthful.

Incidentally, once a purchase order is received at the factory, the installation of a 
Thor Guard system rarely takes more than a month.  Could we make this 
delivery faster? Perhaps.  Unlike Perry Weather products, our lightning system 
goes through rigorous testing and calibration so that the customer receives a 
perfect product.  No off the shelf parts in our house!  Thor Guard circuit boards, 
esoteric parts, along with our incredible engineers, programmers and 
meteorologists are always looking to improve what we produce. 

Price should be irrelevant when it comes to safety.  Honesty should matter too.  
So why would anyone purchase a product from a company who lies about their 
competition?

The following comparison should open your eyes and may make you wonder…



X

X

THOR GUARD ADVANTAGES

The World Leader in Lightning Prediction and Warning Systems

thorguard.com MADE IN THE U.S.A.

On-Site Weather Station

Thor Guard Perry 
Weather

Instantant Lightning Detection - No Waiting

Lightning Prediction of ALL Forms of Lightning

Lightning Prediction with NCAA Protocol
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Audible and Visual Warning (Optional) …….

XHeat Index and WBGT Warnings ……..

XSevere Storm and Tornado Prediction for your 
specific site.  No NWS or NOAA Needed.

……..

XAll Clear Notifications Only When Safe ……..

SMS/Text, Email and Mobile App Notifications ……..

Data Logging of Weather and Lightning Data ……..

XHard-Wired Base System with A/C Power Backup ……..

XOperates Without Internet Access ……..

XTerrific Local Reps Providing Rapid Service ……..

XLightning Timer that creates Unnecessary Delays ……..

Detects Lightning Strikes ……..

XPredicts Lightning Strikes ……..


